
Collaborate with community 
agencies to establish a
coordinated, high-quality, 
measured home visitation 
system for the metropolitan 
area*

Advance trauma-informed 
education efforts throughout 
the community

Advance trauma-informed 
care delivery and education 
through the Council on 
Violence Prevention and 
respective workgroups

Strengthen investments in 
violence and injury 
prevention efforts and 
services

Reduce unintentional injury 
through the continued 
development of the Center 
for Childhood Safety

Continue to provide public 
policy leadership to 
initiatives that promote 
improvements in childhood 
injury and safety

Establish and strengthen 
formal collaborations with 
community agencies 
engaged in violence 
prevention
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*Strategy 2.1 has been amended to better identify how we
intend to address Injury and Safety efforts in the community


